BLOOMINGDALE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NO. 1
DUPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

ORDINANCE NO. 2025-362

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM FIRE PROTECTION
REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY
FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISING FROM THE STORAGE,
HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS AND DEVICES,
AND FROM CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY IN THE
OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES; ADOPTING THE 2024 EDITION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; AND REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 2015-303
(INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2012 EDITION)

ADOPTED BY THE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE
BLOOMINGDALE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NO. 1
THIS 20** DAY OF NOVEMBER 2025




BLOOMINGDALE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NO. 1
DUPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS
ORDINANCE NO. 2025-362

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM FIRE PROTECTION
REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY
FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISING FROM THE STORAGE,
HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS AND DEVICES,
AND FROM CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY IN THE
OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES; ADOPTING THE 2024 EDITION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; AND REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 2015-303
(INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2012 EDITION)

WHEREAS, Bloomingdale Fire Protection District No. 1, located in DuPage County, in the
State of Illinois (the “District”), is a fire protection district duly organized under the laws of the State

of Illinois; and,

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District has express power pursuant to 70 ILCS
705/11 to adopt and enforce fire prevention codes and standards parallel to national standards to

promote fire prevention; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District also has full power pursuant to 70 ILCS
705/6 to pass all necessary ordinances, and rules and regulation for the proper management and
conduct of the business of the Board of Trustees of the District for carrying into effect the objects

for which the District was formed; and

WHEREAS, the Fire Protection District Act, 70 ILCS 705/11, (the “Act”) empowers and
makes it the legal duty and obligation of this Board of Trustees to provide as nearly adequate
protection from fire for all persons and property within the district as possible and to prescribe

necessary regulations for the prevention and control of fire therein; and,



WHEREAS, the District is empowered by the Act to provide reasonable safeguards through
Building and Fire Prevention Codes to protect the Public Health and Safety against the hazards of

fire in buildings and structures and,

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District No. 1
deems it in the best interest of the District to amend and adopt a fire prevention code for the control
of fire protection in buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms as amended of the published 2024 Edition of The
International Fire Code are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part thereof, as if fully set out in
this Ordinance, except for the additions, insertions, deletions and changes thereto as set forth in

Exhibit A to this Ordinance.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained by the Board of Trustees of the Bloomingdale Fire
Protection District No. 1, DuPage County, Illinois, as follows:

SECTION 1: The facts and statements contained in the preamble to this Ordinance are
hereby found by the Board of Trustees to be true and correct and are hereby adopted as part of this

Ordinance.

SECTION 2: The fire prevention code of the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District No. 1
(hereinafter referred to as the "Fire Prevention Code” or “Code") shall hereafter be identical with
the provisions of that publication entitled “The International Fire Code, 2024 Edition™ and which is
incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth, except as amended in Exhibit A to this
Ordinance. At least three (3) copies of the International Fire Code shall be placed on file with the
District and shall be available for public inspection at all times during regular business hours as

provided by law.



SECTION 3: It shall be unlawful to design, construct, alter, enlarge, repair, demolish,
remove, use or maintain any building or structure within the boundaries of the Bloomingdale Fire

Protection District in violation of any terms or provisions of this Ordinance.

SECTION 4: The specific terms and conditions of this Ordinance shall prevail against other

existing ordinances of the District to the extent that there might be any conflict.

SECTION 5: Any person, business, firm, corporation, entity or property owner with a
proven violation of this Code shall be responsible for all fees, costs and expenses, including but not
limited to attorney fees, litigation, adjudication and settlement costs, incurred by the Bloomingdale
Fire Protection District in enforcing the provisions of the adopted Code. All persons in violation of
the Fire Prevention Code shall be subjected to fines as set forth and established in Subsection 113.4,
Subsection 114.4, Subsection 503.4, and Subsection 503.4.2 of the Code. Those Subsections shall

be added or amended as follows:

Subsection 113.4 Violation penalties. Amended to read as follows:

Amend: Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of
the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or
of a permit or certificate issued under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not less than $100.00 dollars or more than
$1000.00 dollars. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been

served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Subsection 114.4 Failure to comply. Amended to read as follows:

Amend: Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation
or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $100.00 dollars or more

than $1000.00 dollars.



Subsection 503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads (page 108, add to bottom of paragraph)
Add: Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads and fire lanes. Vehicles that obstruct or
block posted fire apparatus access roads and fire lanes shall not be fined less than

$100.00 or more than $1000.00 per vehicle per incident.

Subsection 503.4.2 Obstruction to fire department sprinkler connection, (page 108, Add new

section).
Add: Vehicles that obstruct or block posted fire department sprinkler connections shall
not be fined less than $100.00 or more than $1000.00 per vehicle per incident.

SECTION 6: The District’s Fire Prevention Code contains an additional penalty provision set forth
in the body of this ordinance as follows:
Penalties: Any person, firm or corporation violating the terms and provisions of this chapter
shall be liable for a penalty in the amount of one hundred percent (100%) of any unpaid fee
and, in addition, shall be punishable as provided in section 113.4 of this code for each

violation.

SECTION 7: Future versions of the District’s Fire Prevention Code shall be revised by Board
approval of additional Exhibits hereto that amend the current Exhibit A. All such revisions shall

be dated and shall be effective upon approval by the Board of Trustees.

SECTION 8: The Board of Trustees of the District hereby declares that should any section,
paragraph, sentence or word of this Ordinance or of the Code hereby adopted or declared for any
reason to be invalid, it is the intent of said Board of Trustees that it would have passed all other
portions of this Ordinance independent of the elimination here from of such portion as may be

declared invalid.

SECTION 9: Effective Date: This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage, approval and publication as provided by law.



SECTION 10: Recording: This ordinance shall be entered into the minutes of the Board of

Trustees.

ADOPTED this 20® day of November 2025, by the following roll call vote:

AYES: >
NAYS: 0
ABSENT: |

Josc %O;WM ander
President, Board of Trustees Pro
Bloomingdale Fire Protection District No. 1

oomingdale Fire Protection District No. 1




STATE OF ILLINOIS )
) SS
COUNTY OF DUPAGE )

SECRETARY’S CERTIFICATE

I, JOSEPH ALEXANDER, the duly qualified and acting Secretary of the Board of Trustees
of the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District No. 1, DuPage County, Illinois, do hereby certify that

I am the keeper of its books and records and that attached hereto is a true and correct copy of an

Ordinance entitled:

BLOOMINGDALE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NO. 1
DUPAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS
ORDINANCE NO. 2025-362

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM FIRE PROTECTION
REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY
FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISING FROM THE STORAGE,
HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS AND
DEVICES, AND FROM CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY IN
THE OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES; ADOPTING THE 2024
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; AND REPEALING ORDINANCE
NO. 2015-303 (INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 2012 EDITION)

which Ordinance was duly adopted by said Board of Trustees at a regular meeting held on the 20™
day of November 2025.

I do further certify that a quorum of said Board of Trustees was present at said meeting and that

the Board complied with all requirements of the Illinois Open Meetings Act.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand this 20™ d;

N

Secretary, Boayd of Trustees
Bloomingdat€ Fire Protection District No. 1

4
\ —
—~




EXHIBIT A

BLOOMINGDALE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NO. 1
FIRE PREVENTION CODE

2024 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS

The regulations of the 2024 edition of the International Fire Code, as published by the International
Code Council, are hereby adopted as the regulations governing the safeguard of life and property
from the hazards of fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous
substances, materials and devices; and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the use or
occupancy of existing or proposed new buildings or premises in the Bloomingdale Fire Protection
District with such amendments as are hereafter set forth.

Additions, insertions, deletions and changes to sections of the Fire Prevention Code are hereby
revised as follows:

Subsection [A]101.1 Title (Page 24, Name of Jurisdiction, insert in second line)

JInsert: Bloomingdale Fire Protection District

Subsection [A]101.2 Scope (page 24, addition to scope, number (6) and (7) to be added)
Add: (6.) All references in this code to the International Building Code or the International
Existing Building Code shall be meant to conform to the current provisions of the Village Having

Authority.

Add: (7.) All references to the International Residential Code, the construction of One- and Two-
family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) no more than three (3) stories
in height with a separate means of egress are to conform to the current provisions of the village

having authority residential building code.

Subsection [A]101.6 Legislative (page 24, add new subsection)

Add: Legislative — If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance
is, or shall be for any reason to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity
of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Bloomingdale Fire Protection

District board hereby declares that it would have approved this ordinance, and each



section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or

more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared invalid.

Subsection [A]102.3 Change of Use or Occupancy (page 25, add to end of subsection)

Add:

No building upon which a certificate of occupancy shall have been issued shall be
used for a different classification or group occupancy until a certificate of
occupancy for such different use shall have been issued by the building
commissioner; provided, however, that no certificate of occupancy shall be issued
in any event unless the occupancy or use of the building complies with the zoning
law. “Change of occupancy” is not intended to mean change of tenant or proprietor,
provided the new tenant is to occupy the building for a purpose, which would not

involve its reclassification into a different occupancy or use group.

Subsection [A]106.2.1 Information on Construction Documents (page 37, add to end of

subsection)
Add:

Unless otherwise specified by the Fire Code Official, each application shall be
accompanied by a minimum of six (6) sets of drawings and specifications signed
and sealed by an architect licensed to practice architecture as provided by the
Illinois architectural act, or by a structural engineer licensed to practice structural
engineering as provided by the Illinois architectural act, or by the owner of said
proposed building when it is determined to be sufficient by the fire code official.
To obtain a permit, the owner or his representative shall file an application on a
form furnished by the governing entity having authority for that purpose, and
shall include a signed statement indicating the proposed occupancy or use of all

parts of the building and the estimated construction cost thereof.

Subsection [A]109.2 Inspections (page 38, add to end of subsection)

Add:

It shall be unlawful to occupy, utilize, conduct operations, or conduct business on
premises prior to obtaining occupancy or compliance inspection approval from
the village having authority. No building, premises or part thereof, hereafter

erected, or a structure of which shall hereafter be altered or repaired and for which



a permit shall be required as provided in this code, and no existing building in
which the character of the occupancy is to be changed, shall be occupied or used
in whole or in part until a certificate of occupancy and compliance shall have been
issued by the building commissioner. Such certificate shall carry the certification
of the building commissioner that said building, premises or part thereof conforms
to the requirements of this and any other applicable code or ordinance, and that
said building, construction, alteration, repair, use or proposed operation is in
compliance with plans and specifications upon which the permit required by this

code was issued.

Section 112 Board of appeals (page 39, Board of Appeals, delete section and insert)

Delete:

Insert:

Entire section.

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the code official relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there
shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals consisting of members who are
employees of the jurisdiction. The fire code official shall be an ex officio
member of said board but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The
Board of Appeals shall consist of the President and Board of Trustees of the
Bloomingdale Fire Protection District. The President shall serve as Chairman and
the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District’s Board of Trustees Secretary shall
serve as Secretary. The board shall adopt rules of procedures for conducting its
business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant

with a duplicate copy to the code official.

Subsection 113.3 Notice of Violation (page 39, add to end of subsection)

Add:

Upon the failure of the owners of said building or other structure, or the party or
parties interested therein, within five (5) days after the service of the notice of
failure to comply with an order of the president and board of trustees to being the
work of making safe or sanitary or of removing the demolishing said building or
other structure, or upon the failure of the owner or owners or the party or parities

interested therein after beginning such work to proceed continuously without



unnecessary delay to completion thereof, the fire district may take any action at
law or in equity to restrain the use of such structure, or may proceed against the
owner or any person in possession of the same in a penal action before the 18
circuit court in Du Page County for the violation of the provisions of this code.
The Fire District may also, in its discretion, cause the structure to be secured to
prevent access, cleaned of unsanitary conditions detrimental to the public or
removed in its entirety, after the failure, within the time hereinabove provided for,

to restore the same to a safe condition.

Subsection [A]113.3.1 Method of Service (page 39, add to subsection)

Add:

Whenever the building commissioner shall condemn and declare any building or
other structure to be a nuisance because of dangerous or unsanitary condition
thereof, he shall cause a notice in writing to be served upon the owner or owners,
upon the tenant and occupant thereof, if any, and upon the holder or holders of
any encumbrances or general tax lien thereof, if any, ordering and directing said
building or other structure to be put in a safe or sanitary condition or be
demolished and removed. Service of said notice may be effected by personal
delivery thereof, or by mailing a copy thereof by registered mail directed to the
person involved, at his last address known to the code officials or available to him
upon examination of the records of the county treasurer and county clerk of Du
Page County, Illinois, as the case might be and by posting a copy thereof upon the

premises subject to such condemnation.

Subsection [A]113.4.1 Abatement (page 40, add to subsection)

Add:

If any building or other structure has become dangerous to life, limb or property
or to the public because of structural defects, deterioration, or fire damage, or has
become so unsanitary or out of repair as to render the same unsafe and unfit for
occupancy or human habitation, it shall be deemed a nuisance, and the building
commissioner, if and when he shall find any such conditions exist, shall declare
such building or other structure a nuisance and shall condemn the same, and no

person, firm or corporation shall occupy, rent, lease or use such building or other

10



structure with or without compensation. The violations of the provisions of this
section shall constitute a petty offense, and any person, firm or corporation found
guilty of a violation thereof shall be subject to a fine in the manner and amount as

provided in the fire code.

Section 114.4 Failure to comply. (page 40, Amended to read as)

Amend:

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $100.00

dollars or more than $1000.00 dollars per day.

Subsection 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS: (pages 42 — 81)

Delete:

Add:

Delete:

Add:

Add:

Factory Industrial F-2 Low-Hazard Occupancy in its entirety (Page 74)

All factory industrial uses and occupancy classified as Group F-2 shall be
classified as Group F-1. Requirements of this ordinance and code for factory

industrial F-1 shall apply to all factory industrial use and occupancy.

Low-hazard storage, Group S-2 in its entirety. (Page 80)

Low Hazard Storage, Group S-2. All uses which are classified as use group S-2,
shall be considered to be use group S-1. The provisions of this code for use group
S-1 shall apply to such structures. No building or structure shall be classified as
S-2, Low Hazard Storage.

Building Identification. Address numbers shall be visible from the street and
located in the upper third of the building. Street numbers shall be Arabic
numerals and contrasting in color so as to be clearly visible at a location approved
by the Fire Code Official prior to installation. Address numerals shall also be

located on the rear doors of multi-tenant buildings (minimum 6 inches in height)

11



Add:

Add:

along with suite numbers and the occupancy name and shall be contrasting in

color with the background.

Building Emergency Egress Identification: All new buildings and or structures
which are remodeled in any fashion shall have their egress doors marked in
accordance with the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District’s emergency
identification system. Numbering shall be a minimum of six inches in size,
contrasting in color and located in the upper right hand corner of the interior and
exterior of all required egress doors. The numbering system shall designate the
location of the door by alpha and numeric identification according to the direction
the door faces and its orientation from north to south and east to west and

approved by the Fire Code Official.

Void Areas: Where additional ceilings are added during construction or
remodeling there shall not be more than one void space created without the

approval of the Building and Fire Code Officials approval.

Subsection 307.2.2 Prohibited open burning. (page 84, Insert at bottom of section)

Add:

Open burning shall not be used to dispose of landscape material such as leaves,
shrubbery or grass and shall not be used for the disposal of building materials,

refuse or other trash.

Subsection 307.4.2 Recreational fires. (page 85, Insert at bottom of section)

Add:

Recreational fires shall not be used to dispose of landscape material such as
leaves, shrubbery or grass or for the disposal of building materials, refuse or other
trash.

Recreational fires in outdoor fireplaces shall be located on a noncombustible

surface or in areas where vegetation has been cleared away to prevent the spread

of fire. Fire pits shall not exceed four feet in diameter or sixteen square feet.

12



Subsection 310.2 Prohibited areas (page 87, Insert at bottom of section)
Add: Smoking, carrying a lit cigar, cigarette or pipe shall be prohibited in all buildings
used as an assembly hall with seating accommodation, or in which theatrical

shows, amusements, lectures other entertainment are offered, presented, operated

or exhibited.

Subsection 311.1 General, (Page 87, Delete and amend to add to read as follows :)

Delete: Entire section

Add: Temporarily unoccupied buildings, structures, premises or portions thereof,
including tenant spaces, shall be safeguarded and maintained in accordance with
this section. Fire protection systems required by this code or the Building Code
as amended and adopted by the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District shall be
installed, repaired, operated, tested and maintained in accordance with this code.
The building owner shall provide updated key holder information as required by
the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District.

Vacant structures which have been unoccupied for more than 24 consecutive
months shall be required to be inspected prior to occupancy. The building or
unoccupied portion shall be required to be equipped with a full automatic fire
alarm system as specified in Section 907 and be directly monitored by the

authority having jurisdiction.

Subsection 314.5 Parking. (page 89, add new section)
Add: The parking or storage of motorized vehicles shall only be done in properly

designated areas designed specifically for vehicle parking or storage.

Subsection 503.1.4 Posting of Fire Lanes. (page 108, add new section)
Add: The fire code official may require posting of new and existing fire access roads
“No Parking — Fire Lane” signs as deemed necessary to ensure fire apparatus

accessibility is maintained and is able to be enforced.

13



Subsection 503.4.2 Obstructions, (page 108, add new section)
Add: Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads and fire lanes. Vehicles that obstruct or
block posted fire apparatus access roads and fire lanes shall not be fined less than

$75.00 or more than $1000.00 per vehicle per incident.

Subsection 503.4.2 Obstruction to fire department sprinkler connection, (page 108, add new

section).

Add: Vehicles that obstruct or block posted fire department sprinkler connections shall
not be fined less than $100.00 or more than $1000.00 per vehicle per incident.

Subsection 506.1 Where required. (Page 109, Add to end of section)
Add: Key boxes shall be provided on all high rise stairwell exit discharges and on all

Use Group I exit doors as required by the fire code official.

Subsection 506.3 Locking Systems (page 109, new subsection)
Add: All buildings except those in use groups R-3 and R-4 shall have installed an

approved key safe system.

Subsection 506.4 Type and Location (page 109, new subsection)
Add: The Bloomingdale Fire District shall review and approved the type of key safe for
use within our fire district. The key safe shall be mounted on the exterior of the

building in a location approved by the fire marshal.

Subsection 506.5 Electric Security Gates (page 109, new subsection)

Add: The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road or entrance
shall be approved by the fire chief. Where security gates are installed, they shall
be equipped with an approved key switch that activates the operation of the gate.
The key switch and its location shall be approved by the Fire Code Official. The
security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all
times. At properties equipped with security gates, provisions shall be made for

security the gate in a locked position using a double padlock system. A padlock

14



approved for this use by the Fire Code Official shall be provided in addition to the

occupants padlock.

Subsection 507.5.1 Water Supplies. (page 110, delete and amend to read as follows)

Delete: Entire subsection

Add: Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this section and the
standards referenced in Section 903. The potable water supply shall be protected against
backflow in accordance with the requirements of this section and the International
Plumbing Code. Hydrant water flow data used for the design of any sprinkler system
shall be less than 1 year old.

Fire Hydrants. Fire hydrant locations shall comply with the following
conditions.
1. One fire hydrant shall be located within 100 feet of all fire
department sprinkler and standpipe connection(s).
2. At least two (2) fire hydrants shall be located within three hundred
(300) feet of all buildings
3. Fire hydrants shall be located along public streets so that no
portion of the perimeter building will be over 300 feet from a fire
hydrant. Where this is not possible, additional hydrants shall be
located on the premises accessible to motorized fire apparatus.
4. Fire hydrants shall be located that:
a. Access to fire hydrants shall be by all-weather roadways
adequate in width, clearance and strength for fire fighting
purposes. Such routes shall be maintained accessible during
all seasons of the year. Legal provisions shall be required
for private roads. Pumper outlets shall face such roadways.
b. Hydrants should be located within ten (10) feet from all-
weather roadways. At no time shall the closest part of the
hydrant be setback less than three (3) feet from the curb

line.

15



c. Hydrants shall be located a minimum fifty (40) feet from

the building to be protected or at an approved location by

the Fire Code Official.
Fire hydrants used in conjunction with water supplies shall be
approved by the Bloomingdale Fire Protection District and shall be
installed at the same time the water main is installed. All hydrants
shall have a minimum six (6) inch inlet, a four and one half inch (4
14”) discharge port and two- two and one half inch discharge ports
which are equipped with National Standard Hose coupling threads.
The hydrant shall open “left handed”. Discharge ports shall face
the adjacent roadway and shall be installed at sixteen (16) to
twenty-four (24) inches above adjacent grade as measure to the
bottom of the steamer port.
Fire hydrants shall be protected from accidental damage by
approved methods when located in areas subject to vehicle
damage. All protective devices shall be located so as not to
obstruct the normal operations of the fire hydrant.
Plans showing fire hydrant placement and water main size and
location shall be submitted to the Fire Prevention Bureau for

approval prior to installation.

Subsection 510.1 Emergency Responder Radio Coverage, (page 112, insert at bottom of first

paragraph)
Insert:

Radio Communications: When conditions exist with radio equipment which
interferes with the efficiency and use of fire protection equipment and or response
of the Fire Department, a bi-directional radio amplification system shall be
required to be installed within or on the building to ensure a 90 percent reliability
factor for radio use within the structure(s). This system shall be designed to
operate in conjunction with the equipment utilized by the Bloomingdale Fire

Protection District. When any required fire communication enhancement system

16



is installed and becomes inoperative, thus affecting the fire safety of the building,
structure or the occupants therein, the Fire Official / Building Official shall order
the system, unit, or device to be repaired and returned to full service, or the
building(s) vacated until the system is repaired and returned to full operating
service. It will be the responsibility of the owner or occupant to make test,
repairs, alternations or additions to ensure the system is properly maintained. The
radio communication system shall be designed to operate on battery back up
power supply for a minimum of 60 hours. The radio communication system shall

operate on radio frequency(s) as specified by the Fire Code Official.

Subsection 903.2.1.1 Group A-1 (page 142, delete subsection and insert)

Entire subsection.
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group A-1

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.1.2 Group A-2 (page 142, delete subsection and insert)

Entire subsection.
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group A-2

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.1.3 Group A-3 (page 143, delete subsection and insert)

Entire subsection.
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group A-3

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.1.4 Group A-4 (page 143, delete subsection and insert)

Entire subsection.
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group A-4

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

17



Subsection 903.2.1.5 Group A-5 (page 143, delete subsection and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group A-5

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.2 Group B (page 143, add new subsection)
Add: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group B occupancies.
Subsection 903.2.2.1 Ambulatory Care Facilities (page 143, delete subsection and insert)

Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all ambulatory care

facilities in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.3 Group E (page 143, delete subsection and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group E occupancies

in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.4 Group F-1 (pages 143 and 144, delete subsection and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group F-1

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.6 Group I (page 144, delete subsection and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group I occupancies

in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

18



Subsection 903.2.7 Group M (page 144, delete subsection and insert)

Delete: Entire subsection.

Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group M occupancies
in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.9 Group S-1 (page 145, delete subsection and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided for all group S-1

occupancies in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.9.1 Repair Garages (page 145, delete subsection and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings used

as repair garages in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.9.2 Bulk Storage of Tires (page 145, delete subsection and insert)

Delete: Entire subsection.

Insert: Buildings and structures utilized for the storage of tires shall be equipped
throughout with an automatic fire sprinkler system in accordance with section

903.3.1.1 in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.2.10 Group S-2 Enclosed Parking Garages (page 145, delete entire subsection

and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings used

as enclosed parking garages in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 13.

19



Subsection 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages (page 145, add to subsection and delete

fourth line)

Add: Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed in compliance with the latest
edition of NFPA 13.

Delete: Entire fourth line ... "where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 square
meters)."

Subsection 903.2.11 Specific Building Areas and Hazards (pages 145 and 146, delete subsection

and insert)
Delete: Entire subsection.
Insert: In all occupancies an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed for specific

building design or hazards in all locations in compliance with the latest edition of

NFPA 13.

Section [F] 903.3 Installation Requirements (page 148, add to end of section)

Add: Fire sprinkler protection shall be provided at all exterior balconies, decks and
ground level patios of dwelling units and sleeping units for all Use Group R-1, R-
2, R-3 and R-4 buildings.

Subsection 903.3.1 Automatic Sprinkler Systems — Installation requirements — Standards (page
148, add to subsection)

Add: Performance based computer code analysis not allowed for system design.
Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed in compliance with the latest

edition of NFPA 13.
Subsection 903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems (page 148 add to subsection)

Add: Thin wall piping is not allowed. Only schedule 10 or 40 black iron or galvanized
piping shall be installed.

20



Subsection 903.3.1.2.1 Balconies and decks (page 148, delete conditions 1. and 2., add to

subsection)

Delete: conditions 1. and 2.

Subsection 903.3.5.1 Domestic Services (page 149, add to end of subsection)

Add: Domestic water services and associated shut-off valves shall be separate from the
water supply for the automatic sprinkler system and shall be separated on the
outside of the building or structure being served with separate identified exterior

shut-off valves, unless otherwise approved by the building official.

Subsection 903.3.7 Fire Department Connections (page 150, add to end of subsection)
Add: The size of all fire department connections shall be a five inch (5”) Storz.

Subsection 903.3.8 Limited area sprinkler systems (page 150, add to subsection)
Add: Limited area sprinkler systems shall only be allowed when approved by the fire
code official. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed in compliance with

the latest edition of NFPA 13.

Subsection 903.4.2 Monitoring (page 150, delete first paragraph of subsection and insert new

paragraph)
Delete: First paragraph of subsection, exceptions to remain.
Insert: Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and

automatically transmitted to central stations or remote supervisory stations by an
approved AES or similar mesh network radio which manually or automatically
retransmit trouble, supervisory and full fire alarm signals to DuPage Public Safety
Communications (Du-Comm) or other method of notification as directed by the

local Fire Protection District.

Subsection 903.4.2 Alarms (page 150, add to the end of the paragraph)

21



Add: Provide an outside UL listed weather tight visual device over the fire department
sprinkler bell and connection. This device shall be equipped with a blue lens. The

strobe shall activate and stop with water flow.

Subsection 903.4.3.1 Alarm Indicating Appliances (page 150, add section to read as follows)

Add: All sprinkled buildings shall be provided with fire alarm occupant notification in
accordance with section 907.5. Existing buildings shall be required to bring any
deficient areas up to code upon any building additions or alterations excluding
cosmetic only alterations, subject to Building Commissioner and Fire Code

Official approval.

Subsection 903.4.3.2 Alarms Indicating Appliances Test Valves (page 150, add section to read as

follows)

Add: Fire sprinkler system inspector’s test valves shall be located most remote from the
riser and shall be accessible at all times and located no more than 6 feet above the
finished floor and remotely located. On multiple riser systems the test valves shall

be marked as to which riser and area it tests.

Subsection 903.4.3.3 Valve Monitoring (page 150, added to read as follows)
Add: Installation in multiple story buildings; floor control valves with water flow

switches shall be provided for each floor.

Subsection 903.4.4 Automatic Sprinklers (page 150, added to read as follows)

Add: Where automatic sprinklers provide protection to an area with an approved flow
switch interconnected to the fire alarm system protected by the zoned sprinkler
system, the fire district having jurisdiction may require additional smoke detectors

for a more rapid means to identify the location of smoke or fire.

Subsection 903.7 Speculative Buildings (page 150, Automatic Sprinkler Systems, insert new

subsection)

22



Insert: 903.7 Speculative Buildings. Automatic sprinklers in speculative buildings shall be
hydraulically designed for the storage of class [V commodities, as defined by
NFPA 231, to the maximum available storage height in the building. The
maximum available storage height in a building is the clear height dimension
between the finished floor and the median point between the bottom of the high
and low points of the structural members supporting the roof assembly. Automatic
sprinkler systems shall be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA
13.

Subsection 903.8 Hydraulic Calculations (page 150, add new subsection)

Add: A minimum of 10% or 5 psi (whichever is greater) minimum safety factor shall be
provided in the fire protection system hydraulic calculations. The system demand
shall be 5 psi minimum below the seasonal low water flow test supply.

Each hydraulically calculated area, on each drawing, shall be provided with a

copy of the hydraulic nameplate.

Subsection 903.9 Fire Pump Test Ports (Page 150, add new subsection)
Add: An OS&Y control valve shall be located on all fire pump test headers. All fire

pumps installations shall provide an outside test header.

Subsection 903.10 Fire Pump & Sprinkler Control Rooms (page 150, add new subsection)
Add: Provide an outside access door to the sprinkler riser valve room and fire pump
room. This room shall also be equipped with an interior access door that swings

in the direction of egress. Egress door(s) shall be equipped with panic hardware.

Subsection 903.11 Fire Pump Room Rating (page 150, add section to read as follows)

Add: All fire pump rooms shall be a minimum 2-hour U.L. rated enclosure. All fire
pump rooms shall be provided with an approved doorway from the outside and a
door from the room to the interior of the structure. Impact protection will be

required where pump room enclosure walls are subject to physical damage.

23



Subsection 903.11.1 Fire Sprinkler Room Identification (Page 150, add new subsection)
Add: Fire sprinkler rooms located in new or existing multi-tenant buildings shall be
labeled in minimum six (6) inch (153mm) numbers stating “Fire Sprinkler

Control Room” and shall state the address range the system protects.

Subsection [F] 903.4.1 Electronic Supervision (page 150, delete exceptions 2 and 3)

Delete: Entire exception nos. 2 and 3.

Subsection 904.3.5 Monitoring (page 151, add to end of subsection)
Add: Kitchen hood suppression systems shall be monitored by the building fire alarm

system and indicated as a separate zone.

Subsection 905.3 Standpipe Systems - Required Installations (page 154, Required Installations,

add to end of subsection, line 2)

Add: The size of all standpipe fire department connections shall be two and one-half
inches (2'/2") in diameter and shall be national standard thread. Fire
communication jacks shall be provided at all fire department standpipe connection
locations and shall be tied into the building communication system. Siamese
connections for standpipe and sprinkler systems shall be located no further than
ten feet (10') apart and shall be readily accessible. Public water supplies, when
used for the hydraulic design of sprinkler and standpipe systems, shall be adjusted
to ninety percent (90%) of the actual recorded test results. At stairwells, hose
connections are required at both sides of stairwell doors, one connection inside

the stairwell and one connection outside the stairwell.

Subsection 905.3.1 Standpipe Systems - Height (pages 154 and 155, Height, change building

height regulations on lines 3 and 5, and delete all exceptions)

Change: "30 feet (9144 mm) above" to "15 feet (4572 mm) above" and change "30 feet
(9144 mm) below" to "15 feet (4572 mm) below".

24



Delete: All exceptions.

Subsection 905.3.8 Warehouse Storage and Manufacturing Areas (page 276, add new

subsection)

Add: In all new warehouse storage and manufacturing areas exceeding 30,000 square
feet, and where storage exceeds 12 feet high, provide inside 2 ' inch fire hose
valves with 1 % inch reducer to a 1 % inch connection. Locate the valves at each
door entrance to the warehouse and/or storage area. Provide additional 2 % inch
fire hose valves so that no portion of the warehouse and/or storage area is more
than 120 feet maximum travel distance to a fire hose valve. Show the location of
all obstructions and/or racks on the drawing. The fire hose valves system piping
shall be:

a. A separate riser piping system.

b. The 2 )4 inch valves shall be supplied by a minimum of 4-inch piping with 2%
inch drops to each valve.

c. Where system pressures exceed 100 psi provide reducing pressure field

adjustable type valves.

Subsection 905.7 Cabinets (page 156, Standpipe Systems, add to end of paragraph)

Add: Cabinets as required shall be mounted on the floor side of stairwell doors.

Subsection 906.1 Portable Fire Extinguishers — Where required (page 157, delete exceptions)
Delete: All exceptions.

Subsection 907.1.3 Equipment (Page 160, add to end of subsection)
Add: All fire alarm systems shall be of the addressable type and shall be installed per
NFPA 72 unless otherwise approved by the fire code official having jurisdiction.

25



Fire alarm and detection systems shall be installed in compliance with the latest

edition of NFPA 72.

Subsection 907.1.3.1 Equipment - Fire Alarm Panel Requirements (Page 160, insert new

subsection)

Insert:

All fire alarm panels shall provide a minimum of 60 hours of battery backup
service in the case of A/C power failure. All fire alarm one-way radio systems
shall be equipped with 60 hours of battery backup. Code access type fire alarm

panels are not permitted.

Subsection 907.1.3.2 Equipment - Inoperable (page 160, insert new subsection)

Insert:

Any time a fire alarm panel or connected equipment thereof becomes inoperable
due to age or other reasons and is required to be replaced, the fire code official
having jurisdiction may require the fire alarm system for the entire building to be
brought up to current code requirements. Fire alarm and detection systems shall

be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72.

Subsection 907.2 Where required — new buildings and structures (Page 160, add to end of second

paragraph)
Add:

Exception:

All fire alarm control panels shall be installed near the fire department sprinkler
risers with a fully functioning remote annunciator panel located within 10 feet of
the main entrance at a location approved by the fire code official having
jurisdiction. The remote annunciator panel shall be capable of alarm silence and
reset. Code access type fire alarm panels are not permitted. Smoke and/or heat
detection may be required by the Fire Marshal for buildings or areas, including
combustible concealed spaces, not protected by an automatic sprinkler system.
Manual fire alarm boxes are not required in Use Group M in areas of the building
that are normally accessible to the public where the building is equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system and the alarm notification

appliances will activate upon sprinkler water flow.

26



Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and
automatically transmitted to Central Stations or Remote Supervisory Stations by
an approved AES or similar mesh network radio, which manually or
automatically retransmit trouble, supervisory, and full fire alarm signals to
DuPage Public Safety Communications (Du-Comm) or other method of
notification as directed by the local Fire Protection District. Fire alarm and
detection systems shall be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA
72.

Exceptions:

Underground gate valves with roadway boxes.

Subsection 907.2.1 Group A (page 160, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:

Insert:

Entire subsection.

A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group A occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the
fire protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall
be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72. Delete: Exception
L.

Subsection 907.2.2 Group B (page 161, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:

Insert:

Entire subsection.

A fire alarm system in group B occupancies shall be installed and maintained in
accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the fire protection district having
jurisdiction._Fire alarm and detection systems shall be installed in compliance

with the latest edition of NFPA 72.

Subsection 907.2.3 Group E (pages 161 and 162, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:

Entire subsection.

27



Insert:

A fire alarm system in all group E occupancies shall be installed and maintained
in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the fire protection district having
jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall be installed in compliance

with the latest edition of NFPA 72.

Subsection 907.2.4 Group F (page 162, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:
Insert:

Entire subsection.

A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group F occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the
fire protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall

be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72. Delete: Exception.

Subsection 907.2.5 Group H (page 162, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:
Insert:

Entire subsection.

A fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance
with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group H occupancies and shall be
installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the fire
protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall be
installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72. An automatic smoke
detection system shall be installed for highly toxic gases, organic peroxides and

oxidizers in accordance with Chapters 60, 62 and 63.

Subsection 907.2.6 Group I (pages 162 and 163, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:

Insert:

Entire subsection.
A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group I occupancies shall

be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the fire

protection district having jurisdiction.

Subsection 907.2.7.1 Group M (page 163, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:

Entire subsection.

28



Insert:

A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group M occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the
fire protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall
be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72. Delete: Exceptions
1 and 2.

Subsection 907.2.8 Group R-1 (page 163, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:
Insert:

Entire subsection.

A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group R-1 occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the
fire protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall
be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72. Delete: All

exceptions.

Subsection 907.2.9 Group R-2 (page 164, delete subsection and insert)

Delete:
Insert:

Entire subsection.

A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group R-2 occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the
fire protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall
be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72. Delete: All

exceptions.

Subsection 907.2.10 Group S (page 164, delete and insert new subsection)

Delete:

Insert:

Entire subsection.
A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group S occupancies and

shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the

29



fire protection district having jurisdiction. Fire alarm and detection systems shall

be installed in compliance with the latest edition of NFPA 72.

Subsection 907.2.10.1 Public and self-storage occupancies (page 164, delete and insert new

subsection)

Insert: A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group S public and self-
storage occupancies and shall be installed and maintained in accordance with
NFPA 72 as_regulated by the fire protection district having jurisdiction. Visible

notification appliances are not required within the storage units. Delete exception.

Subsection 907.2.13.4 Emergency voice/alarm communication system (page 9-27, insert new

subsection)

Add: An emergency voice/alarm communication system shall be required in all
buildings five stories or more than 55 feet in height and shall be audible

throughout the entire building in accordance section 907.5.2.2.

Subsection 907.2.24 Group R-3 (page 167, insert new subsection)

Insert: A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group R-3 occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the

fire protection district having jurisdiction.

Subsection 907.2.25 Group R-4 (page 167, insert new subsection)

Insert: A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in all group R-4 occupancies and
shall be installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72 as regulated by the

fire protection district having jurisdiction.

Subsection 907.6.2 Power Supply (page 170, add to end of paragraph)

30



Add: Secondary power shall provide a minimum of 60 hours. All fire alarm one-way

radio systems shall be equipped with 60 hours of battery back-up.

Subsection 907.6.4.3 Zones - Disconnects (page 170, insert new subsection)
Insert: Subsection 907.6.4.3 Zone Disconnects. All fire alarm systems shall be capable of
zoned disconnects at the control panel. Disconnection of a zone shall cause the

fire alarm system to transmit a trouble signal.

Subsection 907.6.4.4 Multi-Zone, (page 170, insert new subsection)
Insert: Multi-tenant buildings will be “ring by tenant” and shall include weather tight
clear outside strobe lights over the entrance to each tenant space as directed by the

Fire Code Official. All outside strobes shall provide a minimum of 75 candelas.

Subsection 907.6.6 Monitoring (page 171, delete part of subsection and insert)
Delete: First paragraph of subsection, exceptions to remain.
Insert: All required fire alarm systems other than fire suppression systems shall be

connected to an approved remote station system in accordance with NFPA 72.

Subsection 907.11 Fire Alarm and Sprinkler Rooms (page 171, insert new subsection)
Insert: Multi-tenant fire alarm and sprinkler system room doors shall be labeled in
minimum six (6) inch (153mm) numbers stating “Fire Sprinkler / Fire Control

Room” and shall state the address range the system protects.

Subsection 907.12 Private Wireless Radio Alarm Systems (page 171, insert new subsection)

Insert: Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and
automatically transmitted to Central Stations or Remote Supervisory Stations by
an approved AES or similar mesh network radio, which manually or
automatically retransmit trouble, supervisory, and full fire alarm signals to
DuPage Public Safety Communications (Du-Comm) or other method of

notification as directed by the local Fire Protection District.

31



Subsection 910.2 Smoke and Heat Removal - Where required (page 180, add to end of

subsection paragraph, delete exceptions)

Add:

Delete:

Buildings or portions thereof shall be provided with a mechanical smoke exhaust
system in all occupancies of groups A, B, E, F, H, I, M and S having more than
30,000 square feet (2787 square meters) in floor area. All key switches shall be
“Knox Box” style keyed to the fire protection district having jurisdiction. Key
switches shall be located in the building fire pump / sprinkler riser room, or at the
FACP. Mechanical smoke exhaust system shall be manually operated only and
are not permitted to be tied to the building fire alarm system unless approved by
the authority having jurisdiction.

All exceptions.

Subsection 910.2.1 Groups F-1 or S-1 (page 180, delete entire subsection and insert)

Delete:

Insert:

Entire subsection.
Groups F or S. Buildings and portions thereof used as a group F or S occupancy

having more than 30,000 square feet (2787 square meters) in floor area.

Subsection [BE]1006.2.1 Egress based on occupant load and Common Path of Egress Travel

Distance (page 198, add to subsection)

Add:

The length of common path of egress travel in occupancies in group B, F and S
shall not be more than 100 feet (30 480 mm) for common truck docks which are
provided and separated from other occupancies by 1-hour fire-resistance rated
assemblies, and that are entirely protected throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with section 903.3.1.1. Where shared truck dock
facilities are provided in group B, F and S in multiple tenant buildings, two exits

or exit access doorways from the space shall be provided.

32



Subsection [BE] 1009.1 Accessible Means of Egress Required (page 203, add to end of

subsection and delete exception no. 1)

Add: Accessible means of egress shall comply with the current version of the Illinois
accessibility code.

Delete: Exception no. 1.

Subsection [BE] 1010.1.2.1 Direction of Swing (page 207, delete subsection and insert)

Insert: Side-hinged swing doors, pivoted doors and balanced doors shall swing in the direction of
egress travel where serving a room or area containing and occupant load of 10 or more
person or a Group H occupancy. All exterior doors and doors accessing an exit enclosure
shall swing in the direction of egress travel and be provided with an approved automatic

door closer.

Subsection [BE] 1010.2.4 Locks and Latches (pages 208 and 209, delete numbers 3, 3.1, 3.2 and

3.3)
Delete: Numbers 3, 3.1, 3.2 and 3.3.

Subsection [BE] 1013.3 Illumination (page 221, delete and insert)
Delete: First sentence.

Insert: Exit signs shall be internally illuminated.

Subsection [B]1015.4 Guards — Opening limitations (Page 223, add to end of subsection)
Add: Required guards shall not be constructed with horizontal rails or other ornamental

pattern that results in a ladder effect.

Subsection [B]1006.2.1 Common path of egress travel (Page 198, add to end of subsection)
Add: The length of common path of egress travel in occupancies in
Group B, F and S shall not be more than 100 feet (15,240 mm) for common truck
docks which are provided and separated from other occupancies by 1-hours fire-
resistance rated assemblies, and that are entirely protected throughout with an

approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with section 903.3.1.1.

33



Subsection [B]1015.1 Exit or exit access doorways from spaces (page 163, add number 4 to

subsection)

Add: 4. Where shared truck dock facilities are provided in Groups B, S, and F in

multiple tenant buildings.

Table [BE] 1020.2 Corridor Fire-Resistance Rating (pages 228 and 229, change hour ratings in

table)

Change: All occupancies without sprinkler systems are "not permitted"” in the third column
in coordination with section 903.2, which as amended by this ordinance requires
all buildings to be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with section 903.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 where allowed.

Change: All occupancies with sprinkler systems are to have 1-hour corridor fire-resistance

rating in the fourth column, with no reductions in fire-resistance allowed. Exit
corridors serving fire-resistance rated stairwells shall have the same fire-

resistance rating as the stairwell.

Subsection [BE] 1023.12 Smoke-Proof Enclosures (page 233, add "and pressurized" after

“smoke proof” in line 4)

Add: “and pressurized” after “smoke proof” in line 4.

Subsection 1101.2 Intent (page 248, add to subsection)

Add: Compliance with the current edition of the Illinois accessibility code is required.

Subsection 1104.2 Elevators, Escalators and Moving Walks (page 255, add to end of paragraph)

Add: Elevator and conveying systems shall be in conformance with state of Illinois
section 140 of the elevator safety and regulation act (225 ILCS 312/140), and the
administrative rules (41 Ill. adm. code 1000). Elevator and conveying systems

shall comply with following or most current standards and guidelines:

34



1. Safety code for elevators and escalators (ASME A17.1 2019/CSA B44-2019)
and performance-based safety code for elevators and escalators (ASME A17.7-
2007 reaffirmed 2017/CSA B44.7-07 reaffirmed 2017).

Modification and Exclusion to the Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators
(ASME A17.1-2019/CSA B44-2019) adopted by the Illinois Elevator Safety
Review Board:

Modification: Witnessing of Initiating Devices for Fireman’s Emergency
Operation.

All initiating devices for all elevators shall be tested every 5 years. The test shall
be witnessed by an elevator inspector. Documentation of the results of the testing
of initiating devices must be kept on site in the maintenance records. All hydraulic
elevators shall have this documentation completed no later than December 31,
2024. All traction elevators shall have this documentation completed at the time
of their first Category 5 test after January 1, 2024, After the initial test,
subsequent tests of the elevator’s initiating devices shall be conducted no later
than 5 years after the date of the last test.

Exclusion: Specifically Excluded from Adoption is Section 8.6.4.20.1(b)
Alternative Test Method for Car Safeties.

2.Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators (ASME A17.3-2005)
upgrades required by section 35(h) and (i) of the Act and subsection 9d).
3.Safety standard for platform lifts and stairway chairlifts (ASME A18.1-2017).
4.Standard for the qualification of elevator inspectors (ASME QEI-1-2018).
5.Automated people mover standard (ANSI/ASCE/T&DI 21-13).

Upgrade Requirements for Existing Conveyances:

Notwithstanding anything else in this PART, the following upgrade requirements
of the 2007 edition of the Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators (ASME
A17.1) and the 2005 edition of the Safety Code for Existing Elevators (ASME
A17.3) must be completed by January 2015, but OSFM or the Local

Administrator may not require their completion prior to January 1, 2013

35



Restricted opening of hoist way doors or car doors on passenger elevators in

accordance with ASME A17.3-2005.

Car illumination in accordance with ASME A17.3-2005.

Emergency operations and signaling devices in accordance with ASME A17.3-

2005.

Phase reversal and failure protection in accordance with ASME A17.3-2005

Reopening device for power operated doors or gates in accordance with ASME

A17.3-2005.

Stop switch in pits in accordance with ASME A17.3-2005

Pit ladder installation in accordance with Section 2.2.4.2 of ASME A17.1-2007

In the event that a conveyance regulated by this PART is altered, the alteration

shall comply with ASME A17.1-2019/CSA B44-2019.

Notwithstanding anything else in this Section, the firefighter’s emergency

operation and the hydraulic elevator cylinder or cylinders, including the

associated safety devices outlined in Section 4.3.3(b) of ASME A17.3-2005, are
not required to be upgraded unless:

A. There is an alteration of the controller affecting operation control, motion
control, or combination of the 2 types of control, (1.1) the operation control,
motion control, or combination of the 2 types of control are replaced, (1.2)
there is an alteration to the hydraulic cylinder.

B. The equipment fails.

C. Failing to replace the equipment jeopardizes the public safety and welfare as

determined by the Local Administrator or the Board [255 ILCS 312/35(i)].

Non-Mandatory Guidelines: It is recommended that all conveyances be inspected and

tested in accordance with the following recommended practices. The following list

should not be interpreted as excluding other practices recommended by equipment

manufacturers.

American Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME), Three Park Avenue, New York NY

100160-5990
Guide for inspection of elevators, escalators, and moving walks (ASME A17.2-2017).

36



Subsection 5003.4.1 (page 298, Material Safety Data Sheets, new subsection)

Add:

Where required: The owner shall submit to the Fire District a material safety data sheet
for each hazardous material or substance on the premises. The material safety data sheet

shall include the following information:

a. Manufacturer’s name, address and emergency telephone number.,

b. Chemical name and synonyms, trade names and hazardous ingredients.
c. Physical data; reactivity data.

d. Fire and explosion data.

e. Health hazard data.

f. Special protection information and special precautions.

g. Spill or leak cleanup procedures.

Subsection 5003.4.1 Safety Data Sheets (page 427, Material Safety Data Sheets, new subsection)

Add: Where required the owner shall submit to the Village building commissioner a
material safety data sheet for each hazardous material or substance on the premises. The

material safety data sheet shall include the following information:

a. Manufacturer's name, address and emergency telephone number.

b. Chemical name and synonyms; trade names and hazardous ingredients.
c. Physical data; reactivity data.

d. Fire and explosion data.

¢. Health hazard data.

f. Special protection information and special precautions.

g. Spill or leak cleanup procedures.

Subsection 5003.4.2 Safety Data Sheets (page 427, Material Safety Data Sheets, new subsection)

Add:

Occupancies identified by the fire protection district shall install one or more

hazardous materials information safes approved by the Fire Protection District.

37



This safe shall contain all information as required in section 5003.4.1. The safe

shall be mounted in a location approved by the Fire Prevention District.

Subsection 5003.5 (page 428, Hazard Identification Signs, Location, first sentence)

Delete: "in quantities requiring a permit and".
q q 4

Subsection 5003.5.1 (page 428, Hazard Identification Signs, Markings, addition)

Add: Rooms, cabinets and outside storage areas shall be labeled in accordance with

NFPA 704 listed in chapter 80.

Appendix C Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution (pages 589 and 590, add sections as

mandatory regulations)
Add: Sections C101, C102, C103, C104 and C105 as mandatory regulations.
Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads (pages 591, 592 and 593, add sections

as mandatory regulations)
Add: Sections D101, D102, D103, D104, D105, D106, D107 and D108 as mandatory

regulations.

COMPLIANCE REQUIRED; APPLICATION OF PROVISIONS:

A. Compliance Required: It shall be unlawful to design, construct, alter, repair, demolish,
remove, use or maintain any building or structure in the Bloomingdale Fire District in

violation of the terms and provisions of this chapter.

B. Application to Existing Permits: This chapter shall not be construed to extend to or affect
any construction activity for which a permit was issued or application for permit filed
prior to the effective date hereof, except for fees not yet due or payable, unless the fire
code official determines that any provisions of this chapter or the regulations
incorporated herein by reference should be applied for reasons of public health and

safety.

38



